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Featured Projects

OPEN ROA D A UDI 
In March 2016, RWC completed this 4

storey car dealership. The project
included extensive exterior andinterior
framing details, a sloped 3 storey wall

in showroom, and 24,000 sq ft
ofcustom metal ceilings as per Audi

spec. This is the 5th luxury car
dealership RWC has completed for the

Open Road Auto Group. RWC is very
proud to be  partners in Open Road's

success!

http://www.rwcsystems.net
http://omicronaec.com/omicron-projects/nordstrom-pacific-centre


MICROSOFT EXCELLENCE
CENTRE

Reception

Collaboration Booth 1

RWC completed
this magnificent project in

March 2016. This included two floors
(175,000 sq ft)in the newly renovated
725 Granville St and an accelerated 6
month schedule. RWCaccomplished
25,000 sq ft of floating wood ceilings

and acoustic t-bar ceilings, level
5finishes throughout, feature walls and

8 freestanding collaboration booths.

  Wood Feature Ceilings

Open Work Area featuring linear wood
ceilings



Click HERE to see news on Prime
Minister Trudeau and Premier Christy

Clark's visit to celebrate the opening of
this new technology development

 facility .

Collaboration Booth 4

W HATS NEW  AT  RW C   

RWC's latest significant project is the
new Emily Carr University of Art +
Design, which is inprogress to be

completed March 2017!

This is a 300,000sq ft university, with
complimenting high end finishes

throughoutand a 400- seat
lecture theatre. Upon completion, this

will be RWC's 4th P3 project in our
portfolio. 

RWC is pleased to announce our newest Operations Team member,  Aaron Broomfield
as     Project Coordinator. Aaron has been with the company for 4 years, and has extensive
        experience in the field, which will greatly benefit our Operations Team!

Keep an eye out for our NEW WEBSITE to be launched soon!

 RECENTLY AW ARDED:
Emily Carr University of Art + Design
Tiffany & Co Holt Renfrew
Rolex Shangri-La
Konica Minolta HQ

https://news.gov.bc.ca/stories/microsoft-opens-state-of-the-art-technology-centre-in-vancouver


  

Visit our  website!

https://www.linkedin.com/company/robertson-walls-&-ceilings?trk=top_nav_home
http://www.rwcsystems.net

